Board of County Commissioners

Division of Community Services

Housing Department
910 N Maln Street, Stifte 308 « Bushnell, FL. 33513 « Phone (352) 793-0272  FAX: (352) 568-6604
« Wabsite: hitpfsurntercountyfl.gov

Board of Sumter County Commissioners
State Housing Initiative Program (SHIP)

BID APPROVAL

Applicant; Gloria Graham
Address: 706 Lawrence Street - Wildwood, FL. 34785

Estimated Bid Total: $ 3,582.00 {Roof} & $2,915.00 (Electrical)

Bids submitted on March 19, 2010 @ 4:00pm by the eligible contractors for the
Emergency Repair work of the above referenced case are as follows:

Contractor or Firm Name Roof Bid | Electrical Bid TOTAL
Roof & Electrical

1. BHD Construction, LL.C NO BID NO BID NO BID

2. Danny Bass Construction, Inc. $4,500.00 $2,700.00 $7,200.00

3. DiBarco Building Corp. $4,215.00 $3,945.00 $8,160.00

4, Donle Enterprises, Inc. NOBID NOBID NO BID

5. Dobruck Construction, LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID

8. Gary Heath Construction, Inc, NO BID NO BID NO BID

9. Genesis Construction & Develop. NO BID NO BID NO BID

11. J. G. Parker Enterprises, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID

13. Jerry Walters Constriction $2,835.00 $2,730.00 $5,565.00

14, Lewis Bros. Construction $3,000.00 $2,700,00 $5,700.00

16. Premier Building $2,775.00 $2,885.00 $5,660.00

17. RBC Corporation $3,307.00 $2,455.00 $5,762.00

18. Scott Mann Custom Homes NOBID NOBID NO BID

See page 2 for recommendation.
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Page 2 of 2 (cont. Gloria Graham Prica Bid Approvat 3.19.10}
(Check Appropriate Explanations)

X | recommend the contract be awarded to Premier Building for the Roof repair
and RBC Contractors for the Electrical repair for the specified bid amount.

[] Re-bidding is recommended because the bids exceed 115% of the estimate.
[[] The recommended bid is the lowest bid within 15% of the estimate.

<] The recommended bid is acceptable for the following reason(s):
awarded to the lowest bidders.

Recommended by: Approved by:

GEETA

Housing Depariment Representative Date Ovwmer . Date




