From: Cobb, Richard

Sent: Monday, January 31, 2011 2:53 PM
To: dina.lynch@ameritechelevator.com
Cc: Tharney, Robert; Conway, Doug
Subject: FW: Sumter County Contract

Dina,

I need to know if Ameritech Elevator and Escalator, Inc. is interested in
the contract with Sumter County. I have not received a response reference
the approved contract from your office. I need an answer as soon as
possible, if one is not received, we will have to rebid the contract. I
called your office this morning and was told that you would return my
call. Please respond to this e-mail to let me know what you have found
out or if you require any additional information from Sumter County. As I
stated in the below e-mail, our elevators are due servicing. Please let
me know if you need any assistance from me and I will be glad to help.

Thank You,

Richard Cobb, Maintenance Supervisor
Board of Sumter County Commissioners
Richard.Cobb@sumtercounty fl.gov
352-569-6075

EXT: 6075

From: Cobb, Richard

Sent: Monday, January 24, 2011 7:12 AM
To: 'dina.lynch@ameritechelevator.com'
Subject: FW: Sumter County Contract

Dina,

Have you found anything yet? Our elevators are due a monthly service.
Some are over due.



Richard Cobb, Maintenance Supervisor
Board of Sumter County Commissioners
Richard.Cobb@sumtercounty fl.gov

352-569-6075

From: Cobb, Richard

Sent: Wednesday, January 19, 2011 8:03 AM
To: 'dina.lynch@ameritechelevator.com'
Cc: Tharney, Robert

Subject: Sumter County Contract

Dina,

The Sumter BOCC approved your proposal for elevator maintenance. Have you
received the contract? Please call me so that we can coordinate services.

Thank You,

Richard Cobb, Maintenance Supervisor
Board of Sumter County Commissioners
Richard.Cobb@sumtercounty fl.gov

C: 352-303-5738

W: 352-569-6075

EXT: 6075



